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Materials

Item #1 Asphalt Cold Patch: CP-5, CP-6, UPM/CM & QPR
Company Material Price Delivery Point
Saginaw Asphalt Paving Co. CP-6 $73.51 Tawas

CP-6 $74.86 Oscoda
UPM/CM No Bid Tawas
UPM/CM No Bid Oscoda

QPR $76.01 Tawas
QPR $77.36 Oscoda

Material Price Delivery Point
Everett Goodrich Trucking CP-6 No Bid Tawas

CP-6 No Bid Oscoda
UPM/CM $89.90 Tawas
UPM/CM $88.45 Oscoda

QPR No Bid Tawas
QPR No Bid Oscoda

Material Price Delivery Point
Bedrock Contracting Co. CP-6 $84.00 Tawas

CP-6 $84.00 Oscoda
UPM/CM No Bid Tawas
UPM/CM No Bid Oscoda

QPR $84.00 Tawas
QPR $84.00 Oscoda

Recommendation: Use Saginaw Asphalt Paving as our main supplier for Cold Patch needs and others as alternates.

Item #2 HMA 13A, Loaded
Company Pickup Point Price/Ton
Bolen Asphalt Paving, Inc. West Branch $50.00

Lachine $50.00

Recommendation: Use Bolen Asphalt Paving as our supplier for HMA 13A
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Item #3 Recycled Asphalt Pavement, Loaded
Company Pickup Point Price/Ton
Bolen Asphalt Paving, Inc. M-55 $15.00

Pickup Point Price/CYD
Katterman Trucking, Inc. Katterman Yard $15.00

Recommendation: Use Katterman Trucking as our supplier for Recycled Asphalt Pavement

Item #4 Asphalt Emulsions: HFRS-2M, CRS-2M, AE-90
Company Material Price/Gallon Delivered
Bit-Mat Products HFRS-2M $2.2236

CRS-2M No Bid
AE-90 $2.0236
AE-90 $1.95 (FOB Bay City)

Terry Asphalt Materials HFRS-2M $2.3105
CRS-2M $2.5105
AE-90 $2.0605

Recommendation: Use both companies for products as best meets Iosco County Road Commission needs

Item #5 MDOT Specification Hot Poured Asphalt & Concrete Sealants
Company Material Price/Pound Delivered
Surface Coatings Co. Deery 115 $0.456

Deery 102 PL $0.432
Deery 103 $0.397

Great Lakes Coatings Asphalt Rubber Type II $0.49

SealMaster Michigan CrackMaster 3405 $0.485

Recommendation: Use Surface Coatings as our main supplier for asphalt & concrete sealants
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Item #6 2" Crushed Limestone - Clear, Loaded
Company Pickup Point Price/Ton
Northern Aggregates Alpena $4.35

R.E. Glancy Omer $8.90

Recommendation: Use Northern Aggregates as our main supplier for 2" crushed limestone

Item #7 2" Crushed Limestone - Commercial Grade
Company Pickup Point Price/Ton
Northern Aggregates Alpena $4.00

R.E. Glancy Omer $7.35

Recommendation: Use Northern Aggregates as our main supplier for 2" crushed limestone

Item #8 MDOT Specification 23A Aggregate, Loaded
Company Pickup Point Price/Ton
Specification Stone Products, Inc. Alpena $3.75

Northern Aggregates Alpena $3.90

R.E. Glancy Whitney $6.10
West Branch $5.00

Omer $7.35

Recommendation: Use Specification Stone Products as our main supplier for 23A aggregate
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Item #9 MDOT Specification 22A Modified Limestone, FOB Tawas Garage
Company Price/Ton
R.E. Glancy $9.10

Everett Goodrich Trucking, Inc. $11.29

Cordes Excavating , Inc. $11.65

Specification Stone Products, Inc. $11.91

Elmer's Crane & Dozer, Inc. $8.54

Recommendation: Use Elmer's Crane & Dozer as our main supplier for 22A modified limestone F.O.B Tawas Garage

Item #10 MDOT Specification 22A Modified Limestone - Loadedp
Company Pickup Point Price/Ton
Specification Stone Products, Inc. Alpena $3.75

R.E. Glancy Omer $6.30

Northern Aggregates Alpena $4.00

Recommendation: Use Specification Stone Products as our main supplier for 22A modified limestone, loaded

Item #11 MDOT Specification 22A Natural Aggregate - Loaded
Company Pickup Point Price/Ton
R.E. Glancy West Branch $5.00

Elmer's Crane & Dozer, Inc. Oscoda $5.00 Crushed Concrete
$7.50 cyd

Recommendation: Use R.E. Glancy as our main supplier for 22A natural aggregate, loaded
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Item #12 MDOT Specification 22A Natural Aggregate F.O.B. Tawas Garage
Company Price
R.E. Glancy $9.60

Elmer's Crane & Dozer, Inc. $9.79

Recommendation: Use R.E. Glancy as our main supplier for 22A natural aggregate, F.O.B. Tawas Garage

Item #13 MDOT Specification 29A Slag
Company Delivery Point Price
Burroughs Materials Tawas Garage $21.00

Oscoda Garage $22.00

Elmer's Crane & Dozer, Inc., Tawas Garage $26.50

Recommendation: Use Burroughs Materials as our main supplier for 29A slag

Item #14 MDOT Specification CS2 Trap Rock
Company Price/Ton
No bids were received
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Item #15 MDOT Specification Plain Rip Rap
Company Price/Ton
R.E. Glancy $15.25

Cordes Excavating, Inc. $18.75

Specification Stone Products $21.40

Recommendation: Use R.E. Glancy as our main supplier for plain rip rap

Item #16 MDOT Specification Heavy Rip-Rap
Company Price/Ton
R.E. Glancy $18.90

Cordes Excavating, Inc. $19.75

Specification Stone Products, Inc. $23.40

Recommendation: Use R.E. Glancy as our main supplier for heavy rip rap

Item #17 Top Soil - Loaded
Company Material Price/CYD
Katterman Trucking, Inc. Screened Topsoil $9.50

Unscreened Topsoil $6.50

R & S Trucking, Inc. Screened Topsoil (Esmond Pit) $7.00
Unscreened  Topsoil (Esmond Pit) $4.75

Screened Topsoil (Mill Station Pit) $9.25
Unscreened  Topsoil (Mill Station Pit) $7.00

Bedrock Contracting & Excavating Screened Topsoil (delivered only)* $18.00
* minimum of 50 yard loads

Recommendation: Use R&S Trucking for screened and unscreened topsoil
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Item #18 Culvert Materials 
Company Diameter Gauge Price/Foot End Section/Each
Jensen Bridge & Supply Co. 12" 16 $5.40 $30.00

15" 16 $6.34 $35.00
18" 16 $7.91 $55.00
24" 16 $10.20 $77.00
30" 14 $17.50 $193.49
36" 14 $21.48 $226.46

Diameter Gauge Price/Foot End Section/Each
Contech Construction Products 12" 16 $6.60 $45.00

15" 16 $7.92 $65.00
18" 16 $9.90 $85.00
24" 16 $12.54 $125.00
30" 16 $15.84 No Bid
36" 16 $19.14 No Bid

Recommendation: Use Jensen Bridge & Supply for our culvert needs

Item #19 Steel Beam Guardrail & Posts
Company Price
Jensen Bridge & Supply Co. Prices were not posted as the bid is only valid for 90 days.

Recommendation: Only one company, Jensen Bridge & Supply, submitted a bid firm for 90 days.
Use Jensen Bridge & Supply for any immediate needs, call for quotes as necessary.
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Equipment

Item #20 Shoulder Machine with Operator
Company Price/Hour
Bolen Asphalt Paving, Inc. $115.00

Recommendation: Use Bolen Asphalt Paving as our supplier for a shoulder machine with operator

Item #21 Dozer with Operator  
Company Price/Hour
Katterman Trucking, Inc. $95.00

Bolen Asphalt Paving $100.00

Bedrock Contracting & Excavating * $120.00
*( 4 hrs minimum, plus mobilization charge of $95.00/hr for lowboy rental.)

Recommendation: Use Katterman Trucking as our main suppler for a dozer with operator

Item #22 Trucking Rental
                                    Fuel Prices

Company Under $4.00/gal Over $4.00/gal
Bolen Asphalt Paving, Inc. Tandems $62.50 $64.50 /HR

Tri Axles $90.00 $92.00 /HR
Quads No Bid No Bid
Leads $95.00 $100.00 /HR
Trains $105.00 $110.00 /HR
V-Bottoms No Bid No Bid
Double V-Bottoms No Bid No Bid

Katterman Trucking, Inc. Tandems $65.00 $75.00 /HR
Tri Axles $70.00 $80.00 /HR
Quads No Bid No Bid
Leads $75.00 $85.00 /HR
Trains $95.00 $105.00 /HR
V-Bottoms No Bid No Bid
Double V-Bottoms No Bid No Bid
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Item #22 Trucking Rental - Continued                                     Fuel Prices
Under $4.00/gal Over $4.00/gal

Company Tandems No Bid No Bid
Bedrock Contracting & Excavating * Tri Axles $85.00 $95.00 /HR

Quads $105.00 $115.00 /HR
Leads $95.00 $105.00 /HR
Trains $105.00 $115.00 /HR
V-Bottoms No Bid No Bid
Double V-Bottoms No Bid No Bid
*( 2 hours minimum)

Elmer's Crane & Dozer, Inc. Tandems No Bid No Bid
Tri Axles No Bid No Bid
Rock Tub Quad Lead No Bid No Bid
Leads $84.00 $89.00 /HR
Trains $99.00 $104.00 /HR
V-Bottoms No Bid No Bid
Double V-Bottoms No Bid No Bid

R & S T ki C IR & S Trucking Co., Inc T dTandems $60 00$60.00 $65 00 /HR$65.00 /HR
Tri Axles No Bid No Bid
Quads No Bid No Bid
Leads $75.00 $82.00 /HR
Trains $100.00 $110.00 /HR
V-Bottoms No Bid No Bid
Double V-Bottoms No Bid No Bid

Bowen Trucking Tandems $59.75 $64.75 /HR
Tri Axles No Bid No Bid
Quads No Bid No Bid
Leads $74.75 $81.50 /HR
Trains $99.00 $109.00 /HR
V-Bottoms $118.50 $125.00 /HR
Double V-Bottoms $122.00 $130.00 /HR

Recommendation: Under $4.00/gallon Over $4.00/gallon
Tandems: Use Bowen Trucking Use Bolen Asphalt Paving
Tri Axles: Use Katterman Trucking Use Katterman Trucking
Quads: Use Bedrock Contracting & Excavating Use Bedrock Contracting & Excavating
Leads: Use Bowen Trucking Use Bowen Trucking
Trains: Use Katterman Trucking Use Elmer's Crane & Dozer
V-Bottoms: Use Bowen Trucking Use Bowen Trucking
Double V-Bottoms Use Bowen Trucking 9Use Bowen Trucking 9
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Price/Ton

Work Items

Item #23 HMA 13A
Company Quantity Price/Ton
Bolen Asphalt Paving, Inc. 200-1500 tons $50.92

(not to exceed 50 miles)

200-1500 tons $51.87
(not to exceed 60 miles)

10-200 tons $65.00
(countywide)

Recommendation: Use Bolen Asphalt as our supplier for HMA 13A

Item #24 MDOT Specification HMA Ultra-Thin 
CompanyCompany Description Price/TonDescription
Bolen Asphalt Paving, Inc. Countywide $54.84

Recommendation: Use Bolen Asphalt as our supplier for HMA Ultra-Thin

Item #25 MDOT Specification Shoulders Class II
Company Description Price/Ton
Bolen Asphalt Paving, Inc. 23A Shoulder Gravel $13.25
(Price includes shoulder machine w/ operator, material, trucking, roller, broom tractor and traffic control)

Recommendation: Use Bolen Asphalt as our supplier for Class II Shoulders

10
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Item #26 Pavement Crushing
Company Sealcoat Price/SYD
Warack Trucking 0" to 3" $0.34

HMA
0" to 3" $0.37
3" to 6" $0.45

6" and above $0.85

Bolen Asphalt Paving, Inc. Sealcoat Price/SYD
0" to 3" $0.30
HMA

0" to 3" $0.40
3" to 6" $0.50

6" and above $1.00

Recommendation: Use Bolen Asphalt Paving for 0"-3" sealcoats and Warack Trucking for all HMA crushing needs

Item #27 Pavement Crushing & Shaping
Company Sealcoat Price/SYD
Bolen Asphalt Paving, Inc. 0" to 3" $0.90

HMA
0" to 3" $1.00
3" to 6" $1.35

6" and above $1.85

Warack Trucking Sealcoat Price/SYD
0" to 3" $0.95
HMA

0" to 3" $0.97
3" to 6" $1.25

6" and above $1.85

Recommendation: Use Bolen Asphalt Paving for 0"-3" sealcoats and Warack Trucking for all HMA crushing needs

11
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Item

Item #28 Pavement Marking  
                                           Regular Dry

Item Company/Price
M & M Pavement Marking

4" Edgeline $0.0415
4" No Pass Zone $0.045
4" Yellow Skip Line $0.045
4" White Skip Line $0.06

                                                        Waterborne
Item Company/Price

M & M Pavement Marking
4" Edgeline $0.036
4" No Pass Zone $0.037
4" Yellow Skip Line $0.037
4" White Skip Line $0.037

                                           Regular Dry Symbols
Item Company/PriceCompany/Price

M & M Pavement Marking
School $45.00 each
Railroad $75.00 each
24" Stop Bar $2.00 ft
Turn Arrow $40.00 each
Combination Arrow $50.00 each
6" Cross Walk $1.50 ft
Only Legend $35.00 each
Removal $.40 ft

                                                        Waterborne Symbols
Item Company/Price

M & M Pavement Marking
School $42.00 each
Railroad $70.00 each
24" Stop Bar $1.50 ft
Turn Arrow $38.00 each
Combination Arrow $48.00 each
6" Cross Walk $1.00 ft
Only Legend $30.00 each
Removal $.40 ft

12
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    feet $22.50

Item #28 Pavement Marking - Continued  
                                           Polyurea

Item Company/Price
M & M Pavement Marking

School No Bid
Railroad No Bid
24" Stop Bar No Bid
Turn Arrow No Bid
Combination Arrow No Bid
6" Cross Walk No Bid
Only No Bid

Recommend: Use M & M Pavement Marking for our pavement marking needs

Item #29 Curb & Gutter Type B2
Company Quantity Price/Foot
Hunt Bros. Concrete Contractors,Hunt Bros. Concrete  Inc.Contractors, Inc. 0 100 0-100 feet $22.50

100-500 feet $18.50
over 500 feet $16.50

Curb & Gutter Removal $5.00

Zann Bros. Construction, Inc. 0-100 feet $24.00
100-500 feet $19.00
over 500 feet $17.00

Curb & Gutter Removal $5.00

Recommendation: Use Hunt Bros. Concrete Contractors as our main suppler for Type B2 Curb & Gutter

13
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Item #30 4" Sidewalks
Company Quantity Price/SFT
Hunt Bros. Concrete Contractors, Inc.

0-1000 sft $3.50
over 1000 sft $2.95
ADA Ramps $9.00

Sidewalk Removal $0.75

Zann Bros. Construction, Inc.
0-1000 sft $3.75

over 1000 sft $2.90
ADA Ramps $9.75

Sidewalk Removal $2.00

Recommendation: Use Hunt Bros. Concrete Contractors for 0-1000 sft, ADA Ramps and sidewalk removal
and use Zann Bros. Construction for sidewalks over 1,000 sft.

Item #31 Slope Restoration
Company Price/SYD
Bolen Asphalt Paving $0.50

Weyland Brothers 0.49

Recommendation: Use Weyland Brothers if over an acre and Bolen Asphalt Paving if less than 1 acre.

14
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Item #32 Tires & Tire Service
Company Description Price(New) Manufacturer Price (Retread) Manufacturer
All Around Tire Co. 215/85R16 $110.25 Cooper AT/R No Bid

235/85R16 $124.68 Cooper AT/R No Bid
245/75R16 $130.67 Cooper AT/R No Bid
245/70R17 $125.16 Cooper AT/R No Bid
225/75R16 $123.69 Cooper AT/R No Bid
1100R20 $391.34 F/ST 819 No Bid

385/65R22.5 $310.00 F/ST 839 No Bid
12R22.5 $270.00 F/ST 819 $150.00 Bandag

LT245/75R17 $170.57 Cooper AT/R No Bid
16.9x30 $431.55 F/S 6 ply No Bid
18.4x26 $597.45 F/S F&R No Bid

17.5R25 Snow Wedge $1,253.70 B/S No Bid
Service Call $65.00 Van
Service Call $95.00 Boom Truck

Company Description Price(New) Manufacturer Price (Retread) Manufacturer
GCR Tire Center 215/85R16 $91.75 AT Firestone $0.00

235/85R16235/85R16 $88 50$88.50 AT Fi t $0 00AT Firestone $0.00
245/75R16 $88.75 AT Firestone $0.00
245/70R17 $101.25 AT Firestone $0.00
225/75R16 $100.75 AT Firestone $0.00
1100R20 $341.00 T831 Firestone $148.50 4310 Bandag

385/65R22.5 $318.00 T839 Firestone $0.00
12R22.5 $317.00 FD 663 Firestone $148.50 4310 Bandag

LT245/75R17 $103.75 AT Firestone $0.00
16.9x30 $462.00 SAT. II $0.00
18.4x26 $950.00 ANS Firestone $660.00 R-3 BKT

17.5R25 Snow Wedge $1,300.00 VSW Bridgestone $725.00 CSG Unicure
Service Call $0.00

15
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Item #32 Tires & Tire Service - Continued
Company Description Price(New) Manufacturer Price (Retread) Manufacturer
Ball Tire 215/85R16 $90.00 No Bid

235/85R16 $86.80 No Bid
245/75R16 $87.00 No Bid
245/70R17 $99.50 No Bid
225/75R16 $99.00 No Bid

1100R20 drive $329.86 $126.12 trailer
1100R20 steer $389.34 $139.59 drive cap
385/65R22.5 $308.00 No Bid
12R22.5 drive $307.00 $126.12 trailer
12R22.5 steer $268.00 $139.59 drive cap
LT245/75R17 $101.60 No Bid

16.9x30 $405.00 Akuret Max Trac No Bid
18.4x26 $404.00 Akuret Max Trac No Bid

17.5R25 Snow Wedge $1,549.00 Michelin Snow Plus No Bid
Service Call $0.00 No Bid

CCompany D i tiDescription P i )Price(New)(N M f t P i (R t d) M f tManufacturer Price (Retread) Manufacturer
TCI Tire Centers 215/85R16 $93.00 BF Goodrich No Bid No Bid
(Bid #2) 235/85R16 $99.00 BFG 10 ply No Bid No Bid

245/75R16 $109.00 BFG 10 ply No Bid No Bid
245/70R17 $123.00 BFG 10 ply No Bid No Bid
225/75R16 $110.00 BFG 10 ply No Bid No Bid
1100R20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

385/65R22.5 $475.00 Michelin No Bid No Bid
12R22.5 drive $350.00 Michelin $159.00 XDY Drive
12R22.5 steer $300.00 BFG $128.00 XDHT Hiway
LT245/75R17 $121.00 BFG 10 ply No Bid No Bid

16.9x30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
18.4x26 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

17.5R25 Snow Wedge $1,540.00 Michelin No Bid No Bid
Service Call $75.00
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Item #32 Tires & Tire Service - Continued
Company Description Price(New) Manufacturer Price (Retread) Manufacturer
TCI Tire Centers 215/85R16 $130.00 Michelin 10 ply $0.00
(Bid #1) 235/85R16 $137.00 Michelin 10 ply $0.00

245/75R16 $133.00 Michelin 10 ply $0.00
245/70R17 $155.00 Michelin 10 ply $0.00
225/75R16 $139.00 Michelin 10 ply $0.00
1100R20 No Bid No Bid $0.00

385/65R22.5 $475.00 Michelin LRJ $0.00
12R22.5 drive $350.00 LRH $159.00 XDY Drive
12R22.5 hiway $340.00 LRH $128.00 XDHT Hiway
LT245/75R17 $152.00 Michelin 10 ply $0.00

16.9x30 No Bid No Bid $0.00
18.4x26 No Bid No Bid $0.00

17.5R25 Snow Wedge $1,540.00 Michelin $0.00
Service Call $75.00

Recommendation: Based on our most frequent tire purchases, mounting and repair pricing
GCR Tire Center meets our needs at the lowest cost. Some bids did not include mount and repair pricing.

Item #33 Rubbish Removal
Company Description Price/Month
Sunrise Disposal Service, Inc. Tawas Garage $75.00

Oscoda Garage $75.00

Recommendation: Use Sunrise Disposal for rubbish removal services at both garages.

17
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Miscellaneous Bid Items Received
Company Item Price
R&S Trucking Co. Fill Sand (Esmond Rd. Pit) $0.55/cyd County loads

Fill Sand (Esmond Rd. Pit) $1.80/cyd R&S loads

Katterman Trucking, Inc. Crushed Concrete (21A or 22A) $12.00/cyd Katterman loads
Fill Sand (Katterman Yard) $.60/cyd County loads
Fill Sand (Katterman Yard) $1.60/cyd Katterman loads

Elmer's Crane & Dozer, Inc. Trucking of gravel & other materials $2.65/ton
from Glancy's Omer Pit

22A Mod. Crushed Concrete $5.00/ton
$7.50/cyd

Krenn Bridge Co. Treated timber bridge & 
culvert materials

Recommended by: William Cholger  Date: February 22, 2010
William Cholger, Purchasing Agent

Concurrence by: Bruce Bolen  Date: February 22, 2010
Bruce Bolen, Engineer-Manager
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