
Iosco County Road Commission
2009 Annual Road Services and Material Recommendations
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Materials

Item #1 Asphalt Cold Patch: CP-5, CP-6, UPM/CM & QPR
Company Material Price
Fisher Transportation Co. CP-5 $76.25 Tawas

CP-5 $77.00 Oscoda
CP-6 $76.25 Tawas
CP-6 $77.00 Oscoda
QPR $76.25 Tawas
QPR $77.00 Oscoda

CP-7 UPM No Bid

Everett Goodrich Trucking CP-5 No Bid
CP-6 $75.50 Tawas
CP-6 $75.50 Oscoda
QPR No Bid

CP-7 UPM $85.40 Tawas
CP-7 UPM $85.40 Oscoda

Saginaw Asphalt Paving Co. CP-5 No Bid
CP-6 $77.88 Tawas
CP-6 $79.30 Oscoda
QPR $82.88 Tawas
QPR $84.30 Oscoda

CP-7 UPM No Bid

Recommendation: Use Fisher Transportation Co. as our main supplier of QPR material and others as alternates
for Item# 1.

Item #2 HMA 13A picked up at plant
Company Material Price
Bolen Asphalt Paving, Inc. 13A $47.00

Rieth-Riley Construction Co. 13A $63.00

Recommendation: Use Bolen Asphalt Paving as our primary supplier for Item #2.
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Item #3 Asphalt Emulsions: HFRS-2M, CRS-2M, AE-90
Company Material Price/Gallon Delivered
Terry Asphalt Materials HFRS-2M $2.3055

CRS-2M $2.4759
AE-90 $2.1260

Asphalt Materials, Inc. HFRS-2M $2.4138
CRS-2M $2.6596
AE-90 $2.1096

Bit-Mat Products HFRS-2M $2.25
CRS-2M No Bid
AE-90 No Bid

Recommendation: Use Terry Materials for our supplier of CRS-2M as this product best meets Iosco County
Road Commission's needs.

Item #4 MDOT Specification Hot Poured Asphalt & Concrete Sealants
Company Material Price/Pound Delivered
N ti l Hi h S tM i t C k S lNational Highway Maintenance Systems 34515 t $0 47634515 Crack Sealant $0.476

34221 Crack Sealant $0.481
34516 Poly Flex $0.395

Seal Master CrackMaster 3405 $0.4875

Recommendation: Use National Highway Maintenance Systems as our supplier for Item #4.

Item #5 2" Crushed Limestone - Clear
Company Material Price/Ton
Burroughs Materials 2" Crushed Limestone - Clear $9.10 Delivered Tawas

Elmer's Crane & Dozer, Inc. 2" Crushed Limestone - Clear $10.10 Delivered Tawas

R.E. Glancy 2" Crushed Limestone - Clear $11.45 Delivered Tawas

Cordes Excavating, Inc. 2" Crushed Limestone - Clear $11.75 Delivered Tawas

Specification Stone Products, Inc. 2" Crushed Limestone - Clear $12.16 Delivered Tawas

Bolen Trucking 2" Crushed Limestone - Clear $12.30 Delivered Tawas

Recommendation: Use Burroughs Materials as our main supplier for Item #5.
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Item #6 2" Crushed Limestone - Commercial Grade
Company Material Price
Burroughs Materials 2" Crushed Limestone - Commercial $8.36 Delivered Tawas

R.E. Glancy 2" Crushed Limestone - Commercial $8.45 Delivered Tawas

Elmer's Crane & Dozer, Inc. 2" Crushed Limestone - Commercial $9.45 Delivered Tawas

Bolen Trucking 2" Crushed Limestone - Commercial $10.85 Delivered Tawas

Cordes Excavating, Inc. 2" Crushed Limestone - Commercial $11.20 Delivered Tawas

Specification Stone Products, Inc. 2" Crushed Limestone - Commercial $11.46 Delivered Tawas

Recommendation: Use Burroughs Materials as our main supplier for Item #6.

Item #7 MDOT Specification 23A Aggregate
Company Material Price
R E GlR.E. Glancy MDOT S 23A $8MDOT Spec 23A $8 25 D li d T.25 Delivered Tawas

Elmer's Crane & Dozer, Inc. MDOT Spec 23A $8.95 Delivered Tawas

Bolen Trucking MDOT Spec 23A $9.20 Delivered Tawas

Everett Goodrich Trucking, Inc. MDOT Spec 23A $10.75 Delivered Tawas

Cordes Excavating, Inc. MDOT Spec 23A $11.20 Delivered Tawas

Specification Stone Products, Inc. MDOT Spec 23A $11.41 Delivered Tawas

Recommendation: Use R.E. Glancy as our main supplier for Item #7.
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Item #8 MDOT Specification 22A Modified Limestone - 20,000 Ton Tawas Garage
Company Material Price
Elmer's Crane & Dozer, Inc. 22A Modified Limestone $8.14

Burroughs Materials 22A Modified Limestone $8.30

R.E. Glancy 22A Modified Limestone $8.60

Bolen Trucking 22A Modified Limestone $9.60

Everett Goodrich Trucking, Inc. 22A Modified Limestone $10.75

Cordes Excavating , Inc. 22A Modified Limestone $11.25

Specification Stone Products, Inc. 22A Modified Limestone $11.41

Recommendation: Use Elmer's Crane & Dozer, Inc. as our main supplier for Item# 8.

It #9 MDOT S ifi ti 22A M difi d Li t i k d t t k ilItem #9 MDOT Specification 22A Modified Limestone - picked up at stockpile
Company Material Price
Specification Stone Products, Inc. 22A Modified Limestone $3.35 FOB Alpena

R.E. Glancy 22A Modified Limestone $3.35 FOB Alpena
$6.10 FOB Omer Quarry

Cordes Excavating, Inc. 22A Modified Limestone $3.50 FOB Alpena

Recommendation: Use Specification Stone Products and R.E. Glancy for Item #9, as best meets Iosco County 
Road Commission's needs.

Item #10 MDOT Specification 22A Natural Aggregate - picked up at stockpile
Company Material Price
R.E. Glancy 22A Natural Aggregate $4.70 FOB West Branch

Katterman Trucking 22A Natural Aggregate $9.30 Backhaul only
23A Natural Aggregate $9.30 Backhaul only

Recommendation: Use R.E. Glancy as our main supplier for Item# 10.
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Item #11 MDOT Specification 22A Natural Aggregate 20,000 F.O.B. Tawas Garage
Company Material Price
R.E. Glancy 22A Natural Aggregate $8.25

Bolen Trucking 22A Natural Aggregate $9.20

Recommendation: Use R.E. Glancy as our main supplier for Item# 11.

Item #12 MDOT Specification 29A Slag
Company Material Price
Burroughs Material 29A BF Slag $21.00/ton FOB Tawas

Bay Aggregate, Inc. 29 A Slag $26.85 FOB Tawas
29 A Slag $28.00 FOB Oscoda

Cordes Excavating 29 A Slag $28.30 FOB Tawas - Back Haul Only

Recommendation: Use Burroughs Material as our main suppler for Item# 12.

Item #13 MDOT Specification CS2 Trap Rock
Company Material Price/Ton
Burroughs Materials CS2 Trap Rock $25.75 Delevered Tawas

CS2 Trap Rock $26.75 Delivered Oscoda 

Recommendation: Use Burroughs Material as our main suppler for Item# 13.

Item #14 MDOT Specification Plain Rip Rap - FOB Tawas Garage
Company Material Price/Ton
R.E. Glancy Plain Rip Rap $14.25

Cordes Excavating, Inc. Plain Rip Rap $18.00

Specification Stone Products Plain Rip Rap $20.50

Recommendation: Use R.E. Glancy as our main supplier for Item# 14.
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Item #15 MDOT Specification Heavy Rip-Rap FOB Tawas Garage
Company Material Price/Ton
R.E. Glancy Heavy Rip Rap $17.75

Cordes Excavating, Inc. Heavy Rip Rap $19.00

Specification Stone Products, Inc. Heavy Rip Rap $21.00

Recommendation: Use R.E. Glancy as our main supplier for Item# 15.

Item #16 Top Soil @ stockpile
Company Material Price/CYD
Katterman Trucking, Inc. Screened Topsoil $8.00

Unscreened Topsoil $5.00

Schaaf & Associates Construction, Inc. Screened Topsoil $9.75

R & S Trucking, Inc. Screened Topsoil $11.00
U d T il $7 50Unscreened  Topsoil $7.50

Recommendation: Use Katterman Trucking as our main supplier of Screened and Unscreened Topsoil.

Item #17 Grader Blade Cutting Edges
Company Material Price/Each
Shults Equipment High Carbon 5/8"x6"x6' CDB $46.92

Heat Treated Carbon 3/4"x8"x7' CDB $99.96
7/8"x5"x48" Carbide Insert Edge $263.68

Heights Machinery High Carbon 5/8"x6"x6' DBC $50.88
Heat Treated Carbon 3/4"x8"x7' CDB $115.38

7/8"x5"x48" Carbide Insert Edge $235.55

Recommendation: Use Shults Equipment for our immediate needs of carbon or heat treated edges, and 
Heights Machinery for carbide insert edges.
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Item #18 Culvert Materials 
Company Material Price/Foot
Jensen Bridge & Supply Co. 16 gauge 12" diameter $5.01

16 gauge 15" diameter $6.16
16 gauge 18" diameter $7.45
16 gauge 24" diameter $10.05
14 gauge 36" diameter $18.15

End Sections Price Each
12" $30.00
15" $40.00
18" $45.00
24" $80.00
36" $220.00

Material Price/Foot
Premarc 16 gauge 12" diameter $5.00

16 gauge 15" diameter $6.19
16 gauge 18" diameter $7.49
16 gauge 24" diameter $10.00
14 36" di t $18 0014 gauge 36" diameter $18.00

End Sections Price Each
12" $32.00
15" $40.00
18" $60.00
24" $80.00
36" $292.00

Recommendation: Use Jensen Bridge & Supply as our main supplier for culvert materials and Premarc as 
the alternate.

Item #19 Steel Beam Guardrail & Posts
Company Material Price
Jensen Bridge & Supply Co. 12'6" 12 gauge rail $98.68 each

SKT-350  Assm. $3,678.02 each
Wood post $44.73 each
Steel post $55.35 each

Highway Improvement Co.* 12'6" 12 gauge rail $13.50/ft with post
SKT-350  Assm. $2,175.00 each

Wood post $32.00 each
Steel post $45.00 each

*All shipments add $300.00 shipping charge.
Recommendation: Use both companies as best meets the Iosco County Road Commission's needs for Item# 19.
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Equipment

Item #20 Shoulder Machine with Operator
Company Price/Hour
Bolen Asphalt Paving, Inc. $110.00

Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc. $233.00

Recommendation: UseBolen Asphalt Paving for Item#20.

Item #21 Dozer with Operator JD 550 or equivalent w/ operator 
Company Price/Hour
Sam Rizzotto $85.00

Tawas Sand & Gravel $85.00

Bolen Asphalt Paving $100.00

Recommendation:Use Tawas Sand & Gravel and Sam Rizzotto as best meets Iosco County Road Commission's
needs. 

Item #22 Trucking Rental
                                    Fuel Prices

Company Under $4.00/gal Over $4.00/gal
Fisher Transportation Co, Inc. Tandems No Bid No Bid hr/unit

Tri Axles $90.00 $95.00 hr/unit
Quads $92.50 $98.50 hr/unit
Leads $95.00 $100.00 hr/unit
Trains $115.00 $120.00 hr/unit
V-Bottoms $125.00 $125.00 hr/unit
Double V-Bottoms $125.00 $135.00 hr/unit
Rock Tub Trains/8 Axle Flowboys $125.00 $135.00 hr/unit

Tawas Sand & Gravel Tandems $60.00 $65.00 hr/unit
Tri Axles No Bid No Bid hr/unit
Quads No Bid No Bid hr/unit
Leads $80.00 $85.00 hr/unit
Trains No Bid No Bid hr/unit
V-Bottoms No Bid No Bid hr/unit
Double V-Bottoms No Bid No Bid hr/unit
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Item #22 Trucking Rental
                                    Fuel Prices

Company Under $4.00/gal Over $4.00/gal
Sam Rizzotto Excavating Tandems No Bid No Bid hr/unit

Tri Axles $75.00 $80.00 hr/unit
Quads No Bid No Bid hr/unit
Leads No Bid No Bid hr/unit
Trains No Bid No Bid hr/unit
V-Bottoms No Bid No Bid hr/unit
Double V-Bottoms No Bid No Bid hr/unit

Katterman Trucking Tandems $70.00 $72.00 hr/unit
Tri Axles $74.00 $76.00 hr/unit
Rock Tub Quad Lead $87.00 $89.00 hr/unit
Leads $85.00 $87.00 hr/unit
Trains $100.00 $105.00 hr/unit
V-Bottoms No Bid No Bid hr/unit
Double V-Bottoms No Bid No Bid hr/unit
Super Rock Train $105.00 $110.00 hr/unit

R & S Trucking Co., Inc Tandems $60.00 $65.00 hr/unit
Tri Axles No Bid No Bid hr/unit
Quads No Bid No Bid hr/unit
Leads $75.00 $82.00 hr/unit
Trains $100.00 $110.00 hr/unit
V-Bottoms No Bid No Bid hr/unit
Double V-Bottoms No Bid No Bid hr/unit

Recommendations for Item# 22: Tandems: Tawas Sand & Gravel and R&S Trucking
Tri Axles: Katterman Trucking
Quads: Katterman Trucking
Leads: R&S Trucking
Trains: Katterman Trucking
V-Bottoms: Fisher Transportation
Double V-Bottoms: Fisher Transportation
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2009 Annual Road Services and Material RecommendationsWork Items

Item #23 HMA 13A
Company Quantity Price/Ton
Bolen Asphalt Paving, Inc. 200-1500 tons $52.73

(not to exceed 40-50 miles)
200-1500 tons $53.47

(not to exceed 50-60 miles)
10-200 tons $65.00

Reith-Riley Construction Co. 200-1500 tons $68.00
(countywide)
10-200 tons $88.00
(countywide)

Recommendation: Use Bolen Asphalt Paving for Item# 23.

Item #24 MDOT Specification HMA Ultra-Thin 
Company Material Price/Ton
Bolen Asphalt Paving, Inc. 52.73* ICRC Figures

52.73* ICRC Figures

Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc. less than 200 ton $95.00
more than 200 ton $85.00

Recommendation: Use Bolen Asphalt Paving for Item# 24.

Item #25 MDOT Specification Shoulders Class II
Company Price/Ton
Bolen Asphalt Paving, Inc. $12.85
(Price includes shoulder machine with operator, material, trucking, roller, broom tractor and traffic control)

Reith-Riley Construction Co., Inc. $16.00

Recommendation: Use Bolen Asphalt Paving for Item# 25.
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Item #26 HMA Crushing
Company Material Price/SYD
Bolen Asphalt Paving, Inc. 0" to 3" $0.40

3" to 6" $0.50
6" to 11" $1.00

Recommendation: Use Bolen Asphalt Paving for Item# 26.

Item #27 HMA Crushing & Shaping
Company Material Price/SYD
Bolen Asphalt Paving, Inc. 0" to 3" $1.00

3" to 6" $1.35
6" to 11" $1.85

Recommendation: Use Bolen Asphalt Paving for Item# 27.

Item #28 Tree Removal - Call for Qualification
Company
Heinz Tree Service Qualified 
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Item

Item #29 Pavement Marking  
                                                        Waterborne

Item Company/Price Company/Price Company/Price
PK Contracting/Clark Highway M & M Pavement Marking Michigan Pavement Marking

4" Edgeline $0.034 $0.037 $0.042
4" No Pass Zone $0.037 $0.036 $0.045
4" Yellow Skip Line $0.037 $0.047 $0.065
4" White Skip Line $0.037 $0.047 $0.065

                                           Regular Dry
Item Company/Price Company/Price Company/Price

PK Contracting/Clark Highway M & M Pavement Marking Michigan Pavement Marking
4" Edgeline $0.035 $0.047 $0.049
4" No Pass Zone $0.040 $0.047 $0.049
4" Yellow Skip Line $0.040 $0.072 $0.071
4" White Skip Line $0.040 $0.072 $0.071

                                                        Waterborne Symbols
Item Company/PriceCompany/Price Company/Price Company/PriceCompany/Price Company/Price

PK Contracting/Clark Highway M & M Pavement Marking Michigan Pavement Marking
School $70.00 each $45.00 each $45.00 each
Railroad $100.00 each $75.00 each $69.00 each
24" Stop Bar $2.50 ft $2.00 ft $1.50 ft
Turn Arrow $50.00 each $40.00 each $25.00 each
Combination Arrow $70.00 each $45.00 each $35.00 each
6" Cross Walk $2.00 ft $1.50 ft $0.50 ft
Only Legend $40.00 each $40.00 each $25.00 each
Removal $1.00 sft No Bid $2.00 each

                                           Regular Dry Symbols
Item Company/Price Company/Price Company/Price

PK Contracting/Clark Highway M & M Pavement Marking Michigan Pavement Marking
School $70.00 each $45.00 each $55.00 each
Railroad $100.00 each $75.00 each $89.00 each
24" Stop Bar $2.50 ft $2.00 ft $2.00 ft
Turn Arrow $50.00 each $40.00 each $30.00 each
Combination Arrow $70.00 each $45.00 each $40.00 each
6" Cross Walk $2.00 ft $1.50 ft $0.75 ft
Only Legend $40.00 each $40.00 each $30.00 each
Removal $1.00 sft No Bid $2.00 each
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Item #29 Pavement Marking - Continued  
                                           Polyurea

Item Company/Price
PK Contracting/Clark Highway

School $150.00 each
Railroad $250.00 each
24" Stop Bar $7.50 ft
Turn Arrow $85.00 each
Combination Arrow $125.00 each
6" Cross Walk $2.50 ft
Only $100.00 each

Recommendations: Use P.K. Contracting/Clark Highway for Waterborne and Regular Dry pavement striping.
Use Michigan Pavement Marking for all Waterborne and Regualr Dry Symbols.
Use P.K. Contracting/Clark Highway for Polyurea Symbols.

Item #30 Curb & Gutter Type B2
Company Quantity Price/Foot
Rieth-Riley Construction Co, Inc. 0-100 feet $27.00

100-500 feet $23.00
over 500 feet $19.00

Curb & Gutter Removal $7.00

Schaaf & Associates Construction, Inc. 0-100 feet $24.75
100-500 feet $19.75
over 500 feet $18.00

Curb & Gutter Removal $4.50

Hunt Bros. Concrete Contractors, Inc. 0-100 feet $25.00
100-500 feet $20.00
over 500 feet $16.00

Curb & Gutter Removal $5.00

Recommendation: 0-500 feet use Schaaf & Associates Construction. Over 500 feet use Hunt Bros. Contractors
for Item# 30.
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Item #31 4" Sidewalks
Company Material Price/SFT
Rieth-Riley Construction Co, Inc.
                             4" Sidewalk 0-1000 sft $4.50

over 1000 sft $3.50
                             Sidewalk Removal all quantities $4.00

Schaaf & Associates Construction
                      4" Sidewalk 0-1000 sft $3.90

over 1000 sft $3.25
Sidewalk Removal $2.00

6" Sidewalk 0-1000 sft $4.40
over 1000 sft $3.75
ADA Ramps $5.75

Hunt Bros. Concrete Contractors, Inc.
                      4" Sidewalk 0-1000 sft $4.00

1000 ftover 1000 sft $2 95$2.95
Sidewalk Removal $5.50/syd

6" Sidewalk 0-1000 sft $4.50
over 1000 sft $3.45
ADA Ramps $9.90

Recommendation: 0-1000 sft use Schaaf & Associates Construction. Over 1000 sft use Hunt Bros. Contractors
for Item# 31.

Item #32 Slope Restoration
Company Price/SYD
Bolen Asphalt Paving $0.45

Recommendation: Use Bolen Asphalt Paving for Item #32.
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Item #33 Tires & Tire Service
Company Material Price
GCR Tire Center Service Call $75.00 each

235/85R16 $88.80 each
385/65R22.5 $310.00 each

12R22.5 Steer $270.00 each
12R22.5 Drive $309.00 each

18.4x26 $952.14 each 10 ply

Timmy Tire Service Call No Bid
235/85R16 $88.00 each

385/65R22.5 No Bid
12R22.5 Steer No Bid
12R22.5 Drive No Bid

18.4x26 No Bid

Triple M Tire Service Call $75.00/hour
235/85R16 $79.80 each

385/65R22.5 $298.00 each
12R22 5 St12R22.5 Steer N BidNo Bid
12R22.5 Drive $296.00 each

18.4x26 $873.00 each 10 ply

Belle Tire Service Call No Bid
235/85R16 $88.80 each

385/65R22.5 $304.50 each
12R22.5 Steer $262.50 each
12R22.5 Drive No Bid

18.4x26 $609.83 each 12 ply

Recommendation: Use GRC Tire as our main supplier, and all others as alternates for Item# 33.
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Item #34 Lawn Care Services
Company Material/Service Price
TruGreen ChemLawn 3 each treatments @ $310.00 $930.00

2 each Insect treatments @$120.00 $240.00
$1,170.00

Recommendation: Use TruGreen ChemLawn for Item# 34.

Item #35 Rubbish Removal
Company

No bids were received

Miscellaneous Bid Items Received
CCompany ItItem P iPrice
Burroughs Materials trucking of various road materials $3.00/ton

from Omer Pit

Krenn Bridge Company Timber bridge & culvert materials Various

R & S Trucking Co., Inc. Fill Sand-Esmond Pit- County Loads $0.55/yd
Fill Sand-Esmond Pit- R&S Loads $1.75/yd

Recommended by:              William Cholger Date: February 23, 2009
William Cholger, Purchasing Agent

Concurrence by:          Bruce Bolen Date: February 23, 2009
Bruce Bolen, Engineer Manager
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